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Harmony 
Community Development District General Fund

Payee
Invoice 

Number

A= Approval               

R= Ratification

Invoice 

Amount

AMERITAS LIFE INSURANCE CORP. 101520-0000 R 127.12$                 

Vendor Total 127.12$                 

ARROW PAVEMENT SERVICES INC. 1028201 R 10,500.00$            

Vendor Total 10,500.00$            

BOYD CIVIL ENGINEERING 2812 A 975.00$                 

Vendor Total 975.00$                 

BRIGHT HOUSE NETWORKS - ACH 028483401100720 ACH R 123.98$                 

dba SPECTRUM 028483501103020 ACH R 99.98$                   

Vendor Total 223.96$                 

COMPLETE I.T. 5872 R 50.00$                   

Vendor Total 50.00$                   

DAVID FARNSWORTH 20-Nov R 300.00$                 

Vendor Total 300.00$                 

FLORIDA RESOURCE MGT LLC-ACH 83011 ACH R 10,431.20$            

83127 ACH R 10,102.82$            

Vendor Total 20,534.02$            

GRACE COMMUNITY CHURCH, INC. 101920 R 2,750.00$              

Vendor Total 2,750.00$              

HUMANA MEDICAL PLAN 512980261 R 1,801.72$              

Vendor Total 1,801.72$              

INFRAMARK, LLC 57292 A 5,622.95$              

Vendor Total 5,622.95$              

LLS TAX SOLUTIONS INC 002003 R 600.00$                 

Vendor Total 600.00$                 

NORTH SOUTH SUPPLY, INC. 3358491 R 85.78$                   

3360246 R 4.69$                     

3362680 R 62.22$                   

Vendor Total 152.69$                 

ORLANDO UTILITIES COMMISSION 093020 ACH R 10,930.82$            

100820-9921  ACH R (432.71)$                

Vendor Total 10,498.11$            

Invoice Approval Report # 247

November 10, 2020



Harmony 
Community Development District General Fund

Payee
Invoice 

Number

A= Approval               

R= Ratification

Invoice 

Amount

Invoice Approval Report # 247

November 10, 2020

PINEY BRANCH MOTORS INC - ACH RI1039429 ACH R 490.00$                 

dba ALLIED TRAILERS RI1039430 ACH R 90.00$                   

Vendor Total 580.00$                 

POOLSURE 101295611365 R 307.50$                 

101295611161 R 60.00$                   

101295611364 R 588.80$                 

Vendor Total 956.30$                 

SERVELLO & SONS INC 17699 R 39,667.17$            

17759 R 653.42$                 

Vendor Total 40,320.59$            

SPRINT 2244553043 R 502.22$                 

Vendor Total 502.22$                 

SYMBIONT SERVICE CORP. I9770 R 213.00$                 

Vendor Total 213.00$                 

TOHO WATER AUTHORITY 101720 ACH R 8,684.64$              

Vendor Total 8,684.64$              

WASTE CONNECTIONS 1300569 R 225.00$                 

Vendor Total 225.00$                 

YOUNG QUALLS, LLC 16108 A 10,259.85$            

Vendor Total 10,259.85$            

Total 115,877.17$          

Total Invoices 115,877.17$          



 
 

 

INVOICES 
 

 

 

 









Invoice 
 

                                              
 
        Call Any Time!                                                      3936 S. Semoran Blvd. #118                                                           Licensed 
   Phone: (407) 851-3141                                                          Orlando, FL 32822                                                                             & 
     FAX: (407) 658-6786                           www.arrowpavement.com                                                                Insured 
 
 
     Bill To:                                                                                Job Name: 

 
                            
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
    Date(s):                                        Description of Work Performed:                         Amount(s): 

 
 

 
Payment due upon receipt...Thank you! 

 

Harmony Community Development 
District 
313 Campus St.  
Celebration, FL 34747 
  

Harmony 
 
                    
 
 
 
 
 

10-28-20                        
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Billing Date: 
  October 28, 2020 
 
 

Invoice # 1028201 
 
Demo 875 sf of concrete sidewalk, form and 
pour 875 sf of new concrete sidewalk. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

                 Total Amount Due: 

$10500.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

$10500.00 
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Signed: Date:

Harmony CDD
313 Campus Street 
Celebration, FL 34747

Invoice # 5872
Invoice Date 10-05-20

Balance Due $50.00

25344 Wesley Chapel Blvd 
Lutz, FLORIDA 33559 
https://completeit.io 
8134444355 

Subtotal $50.00
Tax $0.00

Invoice Total $50.00

Payments $0.00

Credits $0.00

Balance Due $50.00

Item Description Unit Cost Quantity Line Total

Setup ZOOM
Meeting

Setup ZOOM meeting. Email Meeting URL, Meeting ID,
and Call in number to client.

(4-hour Zoom meeting)
Harmony CDD 10/29/20 @ 6PMMeeting ID: 830 8872
7617Meeting
URL: https://us02web.zoom.us/j/83088727617 Pass
Code: 144698Call in number: (929) 205-6099

$50.00 1.0 $50.00

Disclaimer



Date: 11/1/2020

Invoice Number: 20-Nov

Please issue a check to: David Farnsworth

Vendor Name: David Farnsworth

Vendor No.: V00136

Check amount: $300.00

Please cut check from Acct. gen acct

Please code to:

Check Description/Reason: website maintenance

original contract period

is from 11/01/2020 thru 10/31/2021

Mailing instructions: electronic payment

Due Date for Check: 15th of month

CHECK REQUEST FORM
HARMONY



FLORIDA RESOURCE MANAGEMENT
383 INTERSTATE BLVD.
SARASOTA, FL 34240
PHONE: 941.343.6160 FAX: 941.343.6118

INVOICE
Invoice No
Invoice Date
Check Date
Period Ending
Payroll Number
Customer Number
DeliveryBob Koncar

Harmony CDD
313 Campus Street

10/18/2020
10/23/2020
10/23/2020

Email All

Celebration, FL 34747

83011
Page 1 of 1

Method ACH
ACH Draft Date 10/22/2020
Phone:407-566-1935  Fax:407-566-2064

547.24FL 0153 FERTILIZER 2596.00 3,143.24
1184.66FL 9014 BUILDING/CLEANER 6103.30 7,287.96

    GROSS PAYROLL AMOUNT 10,431.208699.30 1731.90

Description Charge

Items Processed:
Checks Printed:

Starting Check:
Ending Check:

Total Amount Due 10,431.20

6
6

795966
795971

WagesState  Code Total Charge



FLORIDA RESOURCE MANAGEMENT
383 INTERSTATE BLVD.
SARASOTA, FL 34240
PHONE: 941.343.6160 FAX: 941.343.6118

INVOICE
Invoice No
Invoice Date
Check Date
Period Ending
Payroll Number
Customer Number
DeliveryBob Koncar

Harmony CDD
313 Campus Street

11/06/2020
11/06/2020

Email All

Celebration, FL 34747

83127
Page 1 of 1

Method ACH
ACH Draft Date 11/05/2020
Phone:407-566-1935  Fax:407-566-2064

547.24FL 0153 FERTILIZER 2596.00 3,143.24
1131.28FL 9014 BUILDING/CLEANER 5828.30 6,959.58

    GROSS PAYROLL AMOUNT 10,102.828424.30 1678.52

Description Charge

Items Processed:
Checks Printed:

Starting Check:
Ending Check:

Total Amount Due 10,102.82

6
6

797813
797818

WagesState  Code Total Charge



 
 

INVOICE 
 
 
October 19, 2020 
 
 
Payee: 
GRACE COMMUNITY CHURCH, INC. 
5501 East Irlo Bronson Highway 
Saint Cloud, Florida 32772 
 
Payor: 
HARMONY COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 
313 Campus Street 
Celebration, Florida 34747 
 
 
Fees due and payable under Facility Limited Use Agreement dated 
November 1, 2020, provided that the same is fully executed by both 
parties 

 $2,750.00 

__________________________________________________________________________________ 
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ON OR BEFORE NOVEMBER 15, 2020  $2,750.00 

 
 





INVOICE
Inframark, LLC 

2002 West Grand Parkway North 
Suite 100 
Katy TX 77449 
United States 

BILL TO
Harmony CDD 
210 N University Dr, Suite 702 
Coral Springs FL 33071 
United States

Services provided for the Month of: November

INVOICE# DATE
#57292 11/11/2020

CUSTOMER ID NET TERMS
Net 30

PO# DUE DATE
12/11/2020

Remit To:
Inframark LLC, PO BOX 733778, Dallas, Texas, 75373-3778

Please include CUSTOMER ID and the Invoice number on the check stub of your payment

Page 1 of 1

DESCRIPTION QTY UOM RATE AMOUNT

Management Services for the Month of: November 2020

Administrative Fees 001-531027-51201-5000 1 Ea 5,600.00 5,600.00

Postage 001-541006-51301-5000 1 Ea 14.50 14.50

Copies 001-547001-51301-5000 1 Ea 8.45 8.45

Subtotal 5,622.95

Subtotal $5,622.95

Tax $0.00

Total Due $5,622.95



 
 

 

            Specializing In Tax - Exempt Bond Services 

LLS Tax Solutions Inc. 
2172 W. Nine Mile Rd. 
#352 
Pensacola, FL 32534 
Telephone: 850-754-0311 
Email: liscott@llstax.com 

 

   
       

     INVOICE  
BILL TO:       
       
Harmony Community Development District    DATE:          06/04/2020  
c/o Inframark Infrastructure Management Services    INVOICE # 002003  
210 N. University Dr. Suite 702       
Coral Springs, Florida 33071       
       

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT  

Total billing in connection with the $13,530,000 Harmony Community 
Development District (Osceola County, Florida) Capital Improvement Revenue 
Refunding Bonds, Series 2015 – Rebatable Arbitrage Calculation for the period 
ended April 27, 2020. 

$600.00 

 
     
     
     
     
     
     

     
PAYMENT TERMS     
1. Due and Payable upon receipt  Total  $600.00  
2. Please include the invoice number on your check or wire transfer     
  

 
 

 
       
       

  
  

       

Thank You For Your Business!  
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District Name: Harmony CDD

Date: 30-Sep-20

Invoice Number: 093020

ACH paid to:

Vendor Name: OUC

Vendor No.: 31

ACH amount: $10,930.82

ACH withdrawn from Acct. #: Bank United checking

Please code to: 001-155000-1000

Check Description/Reason: OUC withdrew duplicate pmt in error. Cr. Rec'd in Oct.

Mailing instructions: N/A

Due Date for ACH: 9/30/2020

Requestor: Helena Randel

Manager's Approval:

Date:

ACH FORM



1

Randel, Helena

From: Chalkley, Sally

Sent: Thursday, October 15, 2020 1:25 PM

To: Randel, Helena

Cc: Suit, Kristen; Davis, Paula

Subject: RE: Harmony - missing ACHs #9494

Attachments: OUC LATE PAYMENT NOTICE 09.09.20.pdf; OUC 10.08.20.pdf

Hi Helena and Kristen,

It appears that OUC took a double payment!

They didn’t draft the August payment when the bank changed. I was notified with the attached past due letter. I spoke
with Tonya in the OUC Customer service department on 9/18. She instructed me NOT to pay anything at that time and a
note was put on the account so that the services were not interrupted. Tonya indicated that the past due would be
drafted when the current amount was being drafted, which was around 9/28. However, when OUC did the auto draft
they drafted not only the entire amount due but also drafted the August past due amount of $10,930 .82 again.

The OUC online account shows a credit balance for the duplicate auto draft.





HARMONY CDD

ORLANDO UTILITIES COMM. VENDOR #31

INVOICE NUMBER: 100820-9921 

DATE: 10/8/2020

`

Sep-20

Account # Meter # Service Address 09/09/20-10/08/20

5CR94075 6917 BEAR GRASS RD 15.73$                
5CR94331 3300 BLOCK EVEN SCHOOL HOUSE RD 16.28$                
5CR49717 6900 BLOCK ODD FIVE OAKS DR 16.16$                
5CR94088 3200 BLOCK ODD SCHOOL HOUSE RD 16.28$                
5CR96198 3319 BRACKEN FERN DR 17.05$                
5CR94288 3338 BRACKEN FERN DR 16.39$                
5CR95104 7014 BUTTON BUSH LP 17.05$                
5CR94329 7034 BUTTON BUSH LP 16.39$                
5CR98446 3340 CAT BRIER TRL PETPK 17.26$                
6CD24560 34001 FEATHERGRASS CT 16.60$                
1ZR15702 7255 FIVE OAKS DRIVE SWIM 1,057.71$           
5ZR21669 7600 FIVE OAKS DR IRG 22.93$                
6CD46493 75501 Five Oaks Dr 16.49$                
5CR88761 7124 HARMONY SQ DRIVE S POOL 418.02$              
5CD97805 6900 E IRLO BRONSON MEMORIAL HWY ODD 29.91$                
5ZR21255 7000 E. IRLO BRONSON MEM. HWY UPL 47.56$                
5CR49707 7252 E. IRLO BRONSON MEM. HWY PK 16.28$                
5CD97826 7255 E. IRLO BRONSON MEM. HWY ENTL 51.70$                
5CR49720 7255 E. IRLO BRONSON MEM. HWY TCTR 17.59$                
5CR95090 3300 POND PINE RD 15.73$                
5CR98422 3306 PRIMROSE WILLOW DR 16.28$                
5CR97294 3317 PRIMROSE WILLOW DR 16.93$                
5CR94090 3300 SCHOOL HOUSE RD E1 184.46$              
5CR94089 3300 SCHOOL HOUSE RD E2 25.98$                
5CR94091 3300 SCHOOL HOUSE RD E3 31.44$                
5XD08429 7350 FIVE OAKS DR(new meter 08/20/19) 203.97$              

TOTAL 2,338.17$          
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood 01 246.64$              
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood J 411.60$             
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood l 600.87$              
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood H2 202.37$              

TOTAL 1,461.48$          
MAINTENANCE Phase 2 Roadway 483.27$              
MAINTENANCE Phase D1 178.84$              
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood G 787.66$              
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood H1 328.08$              
MAINTENANCE Phase A-1 544.14$              
MAINTENANCE Town Center 309.29$              
MAINTENANCE Phase 3 Roadway 726.79$              
MAINTENANCE Original 243 2,118.41$           
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood D2 & E 665.91$              
MAINTENANCE Phase C2 500.65$              
MAINTENANCE Neighborhood F 219.38$              

TOTAL 6,862.42$          
1127.21

001.543006-53903-5000TOTAL METERS 2,338.17$          
001.543013-53903-5000TOTAL MAINTENANCE 8,323.90$          

Duplicate auto draft by OUC & Late fee Waiver (11,094.78)$       
TOTAL INVOICE (432.71)$            
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Invoice

Purchase Order Invoice No Date

Job Account No Terms

Harmony CDD

17759 10/1/2020

Net 30

261 Springview Commerce Drive
DeBary, FL 32713

386-753-1100Tel
Fax 386-753-1106

Harmony CDD

210 North University Drive

Coral Springs, FL 33071

C/O Inframark

Description Quantity Unit Price Ext Price

7360 Five Oaks Dr.
Harmony CDD

Harmony

Bill To: Service Address:

FL 34773
Suite 702

Landscape Maintenance for OCTOBER 2020 Addendum for the East Lake Berm

Maint - Contract 1 560.00 560.00

Hort - Contract - Turf 1 67.17 67.17

Mulch - Contract 1 26.25 26.25

A finance charge of 1.5% per month (18% APR) will be charged on all invoices over 30 days past due.

Balance Due $653.42

14073
Approved
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Item Description Price Amount Equipment
SERVICE CALL Service Call - Regular Hours (Zone 1, 2, 3, 6) $98.00 $98.00

DIAG FEE(NO PM) Diagnostic Fee (No PM) $45.00 $45.00

MSCNLR40030 Non-Listed Labor Only Repair (No Parts, Please
Specify).

$70.00 $70.00

INFO Found heater leaking from quest nuts on pool
and source side. Made repair to stop leak and
started heaters. Checked proper functions and
found high head pressure in heating mode.
Found a 22TD and 3#'s of pressure on pool side
coils. Closed valves to force more pool water to
coils. Head pressure went down and I have
14#'s of pressure with a 9/10 TD across coils.
Left heaters set for 88 in heating mode per
customer.

$0.00 $0.00

Date Auth # Method

Bill to
Harmony CDD
Harmony Swim Club
210 N. University Drive
Coral Springs FL 33071

Ship to
Harmony Swim Club
7255 Five Oaks Drive
Harmony FL 34773

Phone Number: (407) 301-2235

Work Order #: 10620 Transaction Date: 10/15/2020 Terms: Net

Invoice I9770

You could have saved $7.00

Subtotal: $213.00

Total: $213.00

Payments: $0.00

Balance Due: $213.00

Symbiont Service Corp.
4372 North Access Road
Englewood, FL 34224

Phone: (941) 474-9306
Fax: (941) 473-9306
https://symbiontservice.com/

Page 1 of 1



HARMONY CDD

TOHO WATER AUTHORITY VENDOR # 58

DATE: 10/17/20

INVOICE # 101720 ACH

ACH DATE 11/17/2020

Sep-20

09/17/20-10/17/20

Account # TOHO ACH 11/17/20

Account Number SERVICE ADDRESS Service Type 

7300 Five Oaks Drive Rclm Reclaimed 658.04$                  

7500 five Oaks Drive Rclm Reclaimed 309.01$                  

0 Bracken Fern Drive Park Reclaimed 59.07$                    

7124 S. Harmony Square Drive PoolCbna water/waste/reclaimed 137.47$                  

0 Five Oaks Drive RM Reclaimed 480.67$                  

3200 Schoolhouse Road Rm Evn Blk Reclaimed 1,415.43$               

6900 E. Irlo Bronson Mem Hwy Reclaimed 348.72$                  

7255 Five Oaks Drive Caban water/waste  37.98$                    

0 Alley Neighborhood ParkC Reclaimed 82.45$                    

0 Pond Pine Road Park Reclaimed 25.63$                    

7036 Button Bush Loop ParkB Reclaimed 99.15$                    

7255 Five Oaks Dr. Reclm Reclaimed 33.99$                    

0 Cat Brier Trail Park Reclaimed 529.05$                  

0 Schoolhouse & Cupseed Road Reclaimed 254.94$                  

6900 Five Oaks Drive Blk Odd Reclaimed 212.87$                  

0 Harmony Square Drive Ent W Reclaimed 1,338.16$               

0 Five Oaks Drive RM Reclaimed 58.49$                    

3300 Schoolhouse Road Rclm Blk Reclaimed 18.50$                    

0 Harmony Square Drive West Reclaimed 62.98$                    

7255 Five Oaks Drive Showr water 6.05$                      

7255 Five Oaks Drive Pool water 39.03$                    

6900 E. Irlo Bronson Mem Hwy Blk Odd Reclaimed 39.40$                    

0 Primrose Willow Drive Park Reclaimed 33.99$                    

7014 Button Bush Loop Park Reclaimed 115.85$                  

0 button Bush Loop ParkB Reclaimed 24.53$                    

0 Catbrier & Bracken Fern water/waste/reclaimed 336.54$                  

0 Harmony Square Drive West Reclaimed 288.39$                  

3300 Schoolhouse Road Rm Reclaimed 319.46$                  

3300 Schoolhouse Road Park water/waste  147.83$                  

0 Harmony Sq Dr & 192 Reclaimed 18.50$                    

0 Schoolhouse Road Park Reclaimed 470.22$                  

7500 A Even Five Oaks Drive Reclaimed 24.77$                    

3400 Feather Drive Blk Even  Reclaimed 438.59$                  

3100 Songbird Odd Block Circle Entrance Reclaimed 218.89$                  
001.543021.53903.5000 001.543021.53903.5000 8,684.64$              
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Young Qualls, P.A.
216 SOUTH MONROE STREET
P.O. BOX 1833
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 222-7206 Telephone
(850) 765-4451 Facsimile
Federal Tax I.D.  59-1480346

Page: 1
Harmony 11/04/2020
Harmony Community Development Dist. ACCOUNT NO:
c/o Kristen Suit, District Manager STATEMENT NO:  16108
inframark@avidbill.com
    

General Counsel to District

 
 

PREVIOUS BALANCE $26,969.25

HOURS
10/01/2020 TRQ Phone conference with DM; Phone conference with Supervisor 1.20 240.00

TL Review Church Meeting Agmt, provide suggested edits, call DM and discuss
with TQ(1); review District Engineers notes and concerns re Brownie's
Contracts - edit letter(1), review Gerhards email, Finalize Letter to Brownies
and send(.25) 2.25 281.25

SRT Isolate billing for Fusilier litigation and add to running tally; email to Supervisor
Kassel as requested 0.40 26.00

10/02/2020 TRQ Phone conference with DM; send letter to Brownie's 0.75 150.00
TL Have parties execute agreement, finalize returned copies 0.20 25.00

10/05/2020 TRQ Phone conference with Chairman; email re board meeting 0.75 150.00
TRQ FUSILIER LITIGATION - Outline 57.105 letter 0.75 150.00
TL Review Meeting notes, listen to Meeting recording, discuss with TQ policies for

returning to in-person meeting(.7), review Governor Executive Orders(.25) and
draft informational email to board(.3) 1.25 156.25

10/08/2020 TL FUSILIER LITIGATION - review all affidavits, easements, and
correspondence, redraft Motion and Letter to Opp. Counsel 4.60 575.00

10/09/2020 TRQ FUSILIER LITIGATION - work on 57.105 letter and motion 3.50 700.00
TL Edit to letter and Motion(2); conference with TQ and SRC re Motion on moving

case forward(.5) 2.50 312.50
10/12/2020 TRQ FUSILIER LITIGATION - Phone conference with Chairman; Fusilier litigation

strategy discussion 1.00 200.00
TL FUSILIER LITIGATION - conference with TQ re letter and motion to opp.



Page: 2
Harmony 11/04/2020

ACCOUNT NO:
STATEMENT NO:  16108

General Counsel to District

 
 

HOURS
counsel(.9) call Chairman(no charge), conference with RY on motion(.2);
revise motion (2.6) 3.70 462.50

10/13/2020 TRQ Work on Brownie's PPA memo and related legal research 1.20 240.00
TL FUSILIER LITIGATION - Edit Motion 1.90 237.50

10/14/2020 TL FUSILIER LITIGATION - Review redline, edit Motion(.4) conference with TQ
re strategy, prepare Discovery and witness list to Fusilier Realty(1.7) 2.10 262.50

TL Review Brownie's invoice, draft Hearing Determining Substantial Interest
Letter and Memorandum of Operative Facts(3); final edits to Church Meeting
Agreement(.3) 3.30 412.50

10/15/2020 SRC Edit/Revise contract re: website maintenance 2.00 130.00
TRQ Work on Brownie's prompt payment memo and letter; phone conference with

Engineer and Chairman 1.00 200.00
TRQ FUSILIER LITIGATION - Work on discovery; email opposing counsel 1.00 200.00
TL Review SRC Farnsworth Website Mtnce Agmt and edit provisions, send to

Supv. Farnsworth for review(.9); review prompt payment act re Brownie's
matter, discuss with TQ, then conference call with Chairman and Engineer re
Punchlist(.9); review DM's changes to Church Meeting Agreement (no charge) 1.80 225.00

TL FUSILIER LITIGATION - review all Fusilier correspondence dating to
December 2018(1.2), conference with TQ (.4) 1.60 200.00

SRT FUSILIER LITIGATION - Initiate efforts to schedule deposition of Plaintiff;
email correspondence to and from opposing counsel regarding discovery
dispute 1.00 65.00

10/16/2020 SRC Research re: return to work policies; Revise contract 3.00 195.00
TL Review Farnsworth edits, consider special meeting requests, advise SRC(.25) 0.25 31.25
SRT FUSILIER LITIGATION - Follow up with opposing counsel regarding discovery

efforts 0.40 26.00
10/19/2020 SRC Respond to Farnsworth email; revise agreement draft 0.90 58.50

TL Review, edit, finalize Independent Contractor Farnsworth website mtnce
agreement(.5) review Insurance coverage denial letter for storm drain(.1) 0.60 75.00

10/20/2020 TRQ Finalize and send letter to Brownie's 0.75 150.00
TL BROWNIES: discuss with Chairman(.1) and Prepare Prompt Payment Invoice

Dispute letter and Exhibit(2); finalize action items for agenda(.2) 2.30 287.50
SRT Finalize and send letter to Brownie's regarding right to hearing 0.40 26.00



Page: 3
Harmony

ACCOUNT NO:
STATEMENT NO:  16108

General Counsel to District

 
 

HOURS
10/22/2020 TL Draft In-Person Meeting Policy 1.50 187.50

TRQ Review policy; legal research 0.75 150.00
10/27/2020 TRQ Prep for meeting 1.20 240.00

TL Draft Harmony Central Road Regrading attachment 1.50 187.50
10/28/2020 TL Call with District Engineer re Harmony Central Easement 0.10 12.50

TRQ Phone conference with Chairman, phone conference with DM, prep for
meeting, review letter from Brownie's, review rules 2.75 550.00

10/29/2020 TL Conference with TQ, review agenda and minutes, follow up on action items,
prepare attorney's report; attend regular board meeting 3.30 412.50

SRT FUSILIER LITIGATION - Correspondence to opposing counsel regarding
discovery efforts/dispute and necessity of Motion to Compel 0.60 39.00

TRQ Prep for and participate in meeting 3.20 640.00
CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 63.25 8,869.25

RECAPITULATION
TIMEKEEPER HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
Stephanie Roman Caban 5.90 $65.00 $383.50
Tristan LaNasa 34.75 125.00 4,343.75
Timothy R. Qualls, Attorney 19.80 200.00 3,960.00
Sylvia R. Talevich, Paralegal 2.80 65.00 182.00

07/20/2020 Webster's Investigative Services, LLC 650.60
08/22/2020 Webster's Investigative Services, LLC 120.00
09/22/2020 Webster's Investigative Services, LLC 620.00

TOTAL ADVANCES 1,390.60
TOTAL CURRENT WORK 10,259.85

10/19/2020 Fee Payment - Thank you - Check #229 -10,390.50

BALANCE DUE $26,838.60



 
 

 

RECEIPTS 
 

 

 

 



HARMONY

Community Development District

Debit Card Invoices

October 1 - October 31, 2020



Date Vendor Description Amount
10/2/2020 Paypal Refund (99.98)
10/9/2020 Ebay ATV Tire 343.05
10/16/2020 Ebay Torqueedo 150.00
10/1/2020 Amazon Super Lube 7.21
10/1/2020 Amazon Dry Erase Board 44.99
10/1/2020 Amazon Chain Saw 36.95
10/2/2020 Amazon Return Battery Charger (35.99)
10/2/2020 Amazon Rubber Air Hose 23.02
10/2/2020 Indeed Indeed 73.65
10/2/2020 Gracier Staff Water 1.85
10/2/2020 Glacier Water Staff Water 1.85
10/2/2020 Apple.com iCloud 200 GB Storage Plan (Apple) 2.99
10/2/2020 Glacier Water Staff Water 1.85
10/2/2020 Glacier Water Staff Water 1.85
10/5/2020 Sunoco Fuel 53.89
10/5/2020 Amazon Air Filter 25.53
10/5/2020 Amazon Catalyst 8.99
10/7/2020 Amazon Hitch Cargo Carrier 91.56
10/7/2020 Wawa Fuel 58.66
10/7/2020 D's Ace Hardware Supplies 149.47
10/7/2020 Winn-Dixie Staff Water 35.88
10/8/2020 Amazon Return Reciprocating Saw (46.49)
10/8/2020 Amazon Reciprocating Saw 99.00
10/8/2020 Amazon Wireless Car Charger 30.99
10/8/2020 Walmart Battery Charger 18.37
10/9/2020 Amazon Battery Starter Kit 145.65
10/9/2020 Creative Printing Yard Signs 159.60
10/13/2020 7-Eleven Fuel (17.99)
10/13/2020 7-Eleven Fuel 80.00
10/14/2020 Amazon Battery Charger 35.99
10/14/2020 D's Ace Hardware Concrete Mix 124.75
10/15/2020 Jami Tires Install 2 Tires 27.95
10/16/2020 Amazon Return Wireless Car Charger (30.99)
10/16/2020 Amazon Gloves 19.77
10/16/2020 Amazon Trailer Lights 15.99
10/16/2020 Amazon Reciprocating Saw Blade 51.00
10/19/2020 Amazon Shop Towels 20.98
10/19/2020 Amazon Motor Oil 104.99

TOTAL 1,816.83

Monthly Debit Card Purchases

Oct-20
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